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Title 4- DEPARTMENT OF ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT 
Division 240- Public Service Commission 

Chapter 2 - Practice and Procedure 

ORDER OF RULEMAKING 

By the authority vested in the Missouri Public Service Commission under section 386.410, 
RSMo 2000, the commission amends a rule as follows: 

4 CSR 240-2.075 is amended. 

A notice of proposed mlemaking containing the text of the proposed amendments was published 
in the Missouri Register on April 15, 2011 (36 MoReg 1053). No changes have been made in the 
proposed amendment, so it is not reprinted here. These proposed amendments become effective 
thirty (30) days after publication in the Code of State Regulations. 

SUMMARY OF COMMENTS: A public hearing on the proposed amendments was held 
May 19,2011, and the public comment period ended May 16,2011. Two (2) written comments 
were received and two (2) commenters testified at the public hearing. 

COMMENT #1: Rick Zucker, on behalf of Laclede Gas Company, and Wendy Tatro, on behalf 
of Union Electric Company, d/b/a Ameren Missouri, jointly filed written comments. They 
commented that they were in favor of the changes to this rule requiring an intervention request 
being made as a motion rather than an application. 

RESPONSE: No change was made as a result of this comment. 

COMMENT #2: Lewis Mills, on behalf of the Office of the Public Counsel, commented in 
writing and again at the hearing that section (11) should be clarified to state that it applies to only 
post-hearing or pre-hearing briefs and not to other types of filings. Mr. Mills also stated it should 
be the exception to the mle for non-parties to make filings in a case. 

Rick Zucker, on behalf of Laclede Gas Company, responded at the hearing that there are 
situations other than post-hearing briefs where non-parties may want to make a filing and where 
the commission may be interested in what a non-party has to say about the particular situation 
(for example, jurisdictional questions, motions for summary determination, and motions to 
dismiss). Mr. Zucker stated that the commission should not limit amicus briefs to the time 
surrounding the hearing. Mr. Zucker also stated that the mle currently does not allow for the 
filing of other pleadings and that it should not be changed. 
RESPONSE: The commission agrees with Mr. Mills that a non-party filing a pleading should 
not be a regular occurrence, but rather an unusual event. That is precisely why the rule contains 
a requirement that such a non-party seek permission to file a "brief." The mle, however, does 
not need clarification. It clearly states that a non-party may request permission to file a brief. 
That brief may be filed, with permission of the commission, at any time prior to the filing of 
"initial briefs." Thus, there is no reason that a non-party cannot request ~2!U2}il!l.Jlll"""' 
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amicus curiae brief to express its opinion regarding a motion to dismiss, a motion for summary 
determination, or other jurisdictional or legal question. If the non-party has an interest in the 
matter, then it may be appropriate for the non-party to seek intervention under the other sections 
of the rule in order to file pleadings in the matter. The commission makes no changes as a result 
of these comments. 




