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GENERAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS FOR GAS SERVICE 

 
 (B) Company  shall  discontinue service only after written notice has been sent to  

customer  at least ten (10) days prior to the date of the proposed discontinuance.  
Service of notice by first class mail is complete  upon  mailing.  Service of electronic 
notice is complete upon delivery of the notice to the site where the electronic bill is 
posted.  If written notice is  delivered in hand to  customer, it shall be done at least 96 
hours prior to discontinuance.  The Company shall maintain the accurate record of the 
date of mailing or delivery.  The notice of discontinuance of service shall not be issued 
as to a bill or portion of a bill currently the subject of a dispute pending  with Company 
or the  Commission nor shall such a  notice be issued as  to any bill or portion of a bill 
which is the subject  of a settlement agreement except after breach of a settlement 
agreement, unless Company inadvertently issues such notice in which case Company 
shall take necessary steps to withdraw or cancel such notice. 

 
 (C) Multi-family  -  Single Meter:  At least ten (10) days prior to discontinuance of service 

for non-payment of a bill or deposit at a multi-dwelling unit residential building at which 
usage is measured by a single meter, notice of Company's intent to discontinue 
service shall be conspicuously posted in public areas of the building,  provided, 
however, that such notices shall not be required if Company is not aware that  said 
structure  is a single metered multi-dwelling unit residential building.  Such notices 
shall  include the date on or after which discontinuance may occur and advise of 
tenant rights pursuant to section 441.650 RSMo.  Company shall not be required to 
provide notice in individual situations where safety of employees is  endangered. 

 
 (D) Multi-family  -  Multiple Meter:  At least ten (10) days prior to discontinuance of service 

for non-payment of a bill or deposit at a multi-dwelling unit  residential  building  where 
each unit is individually  metered  and  at which a single customer is responsible for 
payment for service in all units in the building  or  at a residence in which the occupant 
using gas  service is not Company's customer, the occupant(s) shall be given written 
notice of Company's intent to discontinue service,  provided  however that such notice 
shall not be  required unless one (1) occupant has advised Company or Company is 
otherwise  aware that he is not customer.  In the  case  of a  multi-dwelling unit  
residential   building   where  each  unit  is individually metered or in the case of a 
single family  residence, the notice provided to the occupant  of  the unit for which 
service is about to be discontinued shall  outline  the procedure by which the occupant 
thereof may apply for the same character  of service presently being received through 
that meter. 

 
 
DATE OF ISSUE April        28,     2008 DATE EFFECTIVE May              28,    2008 
  month day year  month day year 
 
ISSUED BY      Michael R. Noack Director, Rates and Regulatory Affairs 
                   Missouri Gas Energy      Kansas City, MO  64111 


