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*Legal Description of the Lake Sherwood Estates Service Area 

 
The area served is part of Warren County and St. Charles County, Missouri and is more particularly 
described as follows:  
 
Beginning at the northwest corner of the Northeast Quarter of Section 11, Township 45 North, Range 
1 West; thence along the north line of said Northeast Quarter of Section 11, Easterly 2639.89 feet 
more or less to the northwest corner of the Northwest Quarter of Section 12; thence along the north 
line of said Northwest Quarter of Section 12, Easterly 2664.00 feet more or less to the northeast 
corner of said Northwest Quarter of Section 12; thence along the east line of said Northwest Quarter 
of Section 12, Southerly 1322.17 feet more or less to the northwest corner of the South Half of the 
Northeast Quarter of Section 12; thence along the north line of said South Half of the Northeast 
Quarter of Section 12, Easterly 2627.12 feet more or less to the northeast corner of said South Half of 
the Northeast Quarter of Section 12; thence along the east line of the Northeast Quarter of Section 12, 
Northerly 190.65 feet more or less; thence leaving said east line of the Northeast Quarter of Section 
12, Easterly 552.79 feet more or less; thence Southerly 677.63 feet more or less; thence Easterly 
394.45 feet more or less; thence Southerly 676.43 feet more or less; thence Westerly 945.96 feet more 
or less to the east line of Section 12; thence along said east line of Section 12, Southerly 1561.54 feet 
more or less; thence leaving said east line of Section 12, Westerly 1370.71 feet more or less; thence 
Southerly 1305.73 feet more or less; thence Easterly 1354.07 feet more or less to the northeast corner 
of the Northeast Quarter of Section 13; thence along the east line of said Northeast Quarter of Section 
13, Southerly 1390.50 feet more or less  to the southeast corner of the North Half of the Northeast 
Quarter of Section 13; thence along the south line of said North Half of the Northeast Quarter of 
Section 13, Westerly 2615.47 feet more or less to the southwest corner of said North Half of the 
Northeast Quarter of Section 13; thence Southerly 1356.75 feet more or less to the southeast corner of 
the Northwest Quarter of Section 13; thence Southerly 1367.97 feet more or less; thence Westerly 
1328.63 feet more or less; thence Northerly 1353.37 feet more or less; thence Westerly 1292.57 feet 
more or less to the southwest corner of the Northwest Quarter of Section 13; thence along the west 
line of said Northwest Quarter of Section 13, Northerly 1343.42 feet more or less; thence leaving the 
west line of said Northwest Quarter of Section 13, Westerly 1302.29 feet more or less; thence 
Northerly 1371.04 feet more or less; thence Westerly 1334.89 feet more or less to the southwest 
corner of the Southeast Quarter of Section 11; thence along the west line of said Southeast Quarter of 
Section 11, Northwesterly 2667.88 feet more or less to the northwest corner of said Southeast Quarter 
of Section 11; thence along the west line of the Northeast Quarter of Section 11, Northerly 2604.46 
feet more or less to the point of beginning, containing 1212.25 acres more or less.  Subject to survey. 
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*Schedule of Rates (continued)  

(Lake Sherwood) 

Monthly Minimum  $13.65 

Commodity Charge: $4.10 / 1,000 gallons 
 
 

TAXES - These rates do not include any municipal, state or federal taxes computed on 
either billing or consumption such taxes applicable shall be added as separate items in 
rendering each bill. 
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