BEFORE THE PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION
OF THE STATE OF MISSOURI

Brett Felber,

Complainant,
File No. EC-2025-0301

V.

Union Electric Company d/b/a Ameren
Missouri,

N N N N N N N N N

Respondent.
NOTICE OF EX PARTE COMMUNICATION
Issue Date: May 9, 2025
From May 1, 2025, to May 9, 2025, the Regulatory Law Judge issuing this notice
received five emails from Complainant, Brett Felber. Those emails are attached to this
notice and are ex parte communications outside of the case process, as defined by
Commission Rule 20 CSR 4240-4.015. This notice is given pursuant to Commission Rule
20 CSR 4240-4.020(3).

BY THE COMMISSION

Nancy Dippell
Secretary

John T. Clark, Senior Regulatory Law Judge,
by delegation of authority pursuant to
Section 386.240, RSMo 2016.

Dated at Jefferson City, Missouri,
on this 9" day of May, 2025.



From: Brett Felber

Subject: Commission Complaint

Date: Thursday, May 01, 2025 3:26:36 PM

Good afternoon. I'm going to cut right to the chase on my complaint. I'm not interested in long
written excuses or deflections. I've had two years of those almost out of you all. I want straight
to the point who the author of that document 1s. Who is the "senior software engineer?" I want
to know the exact word for word those coding words mean in sentences and paragraphs. Along
with the Ameren logo and other specific sentence structure is interpreted out of those "coding"
words.

As of right now, here's my list of who really is the "senior software engineer." The first name
starts with an[JJand the last name starts with a [l

Also, keep in mind, Ameren wrote it. Not me, so therefore since they had the audacity to try
and sneak such an asinine piece of paper or fake document into the equation was just pretty
stupid to do. Ameren wrote it, so they deserve to be subjected to answering the question.

Man, out of all the actual "payment agreements" that anyone has actually had or have.
Confidential exhibit D surely stands out from the rest of them. With tons of typos, incorrect
email addresses. No time and date stamp. Encryption security details. The author or Ameren
logo. I can keep the list going on. What about the wutable?

Was this document a "special" payment agreement?

I just want to know who the author is, because even circling back to EC-2023-0395, there's
that nifty comment my buddy, Judge John Clark stated that Ameren was supposed to have
someone readily available to answer questions about that document? Do you need that page
number? Or can you remember that without having to look back?

Speaking of that? Why didn't Ameren have a "senior software engineer" available for the
hearing? Does|| | l01d a software engineer license in the State of Missouri? I get it.
the "senior software engineer" is invisible, just like the missing Ameren logo and other
corresponding information.

Play it the way you want to. I'll keep on going or Ameren can easily tell me who the author is.

It's also illegal in the State of Missouri to defraud someone out of money prior to an agreed
date and to use a counterfeit or non-authored document to defraud someone out of money. It's
called theft by deception. Plus theft of funds. Over S|Jilis quite the felony in Missouri, but
you are all attorney's so you should probably already know that.

I just want to know the author so I can pass it along to the Prosecuting Attorney's Office. If I
don't get the author of the document, I'll just pass | | | Bl formation over to the
PA's Office as she's allowing Ameren to defraud customers. She's allowing Ameren to use
counterfeit documents and not disclosing who the author of that document is.

Counterfeit documents have consequences. Learn to deal with it. That's essentially what you



all made me do. So learn to deal with it.

It's also 2025. So you aren't fooling anyone.

I have one more favor to ask. I would respectfully like my EFIS credentials reinstated
therefore I can upload all those nifty payment agreements, therefore you can compare and
contrast between them all. I also "promise" not to file anything besides any and all exhibits,
when the appropriate time comes.

I'd also like to know why Ameren failed to send me out a rate hike hearing notice? I believe
that is up to a $1,500.00 fine in the State Of Missouri for failing to mail out a hearing notice to
a rate payer?

I look forward to the author of the documents name!

Brett Felber



From: Brett Felber

To:
Cc:
Subject: Commission complaint

Date: Thursday, May 08, 2025 9:33:24 AM

Well, how are all my ||| Il doing? 1 see the head- Mr. Clark dismissed my

complaint!!
Oh, and instead of adding words into my complaint that I never said. I never demanded
anything. If anything, I asked for the Commission to look at the payment agreements, and

make a decision based solely off that.

Oh, trust me. If I demanded my S Oack, it’s going to be me sending the police out to
question you about the money that Mr. Clark ordered Ameren to steal.

Then again, Mr. Clark is a - himself, and that is what [ N RSN 0. They
manipulate objects to what they feel they should state. He’s a I EEEE

So, I want to know? Where’s my $_ at Ameren and Mr. Clark? When’s it going to be
returned?

Maybe on the two year anniversary of the illegal disconnection?

Oh and if you think I’m playing around with that question, I really am not.

I know what I should do. I should be like Ameren. Send out a delinquency letter and email.
Well here’s that delinquency letter. Ameren has until May 18, 2025 to reimburse the

S 21.d admit to the St. Louis County Police Department that thei stole that monei and

published a very serious counterfeit document. The fake agreement , by

It’s the document with NO Ameren logo, email address, author of the document. Fake and
bogus coding words.

May 19th, my anniversary gift is coming true! Just wait! Keep in mind, I never published or
furnished a foke docunent, ik I

We can’t forget with the help of | JJClak.

Welp find a way to get me my money before the police get more involved. In fact for all you
know, the police could already be involved. I'm just saving each and every email to show
Ameren and Mr.Clarks non-compliance and further liability of *

I’1l talk to you all on the 19th of May!

While you’re at it, you can tell the police your alias names are ||| GcKcKNGNGN

Oh and you all are serious I you believe anything you read or put on your



counterfeit document!
Be responsible Ameren and pay your egal obligated debts you owe.
Enjoy your counterfeit document, you

Brett




From: Brett Felber

To:

Cc:

Subject: Ameren Complaint

Date: Thursday, May 08, 2025 1:30:13 PM
Attachments: Ameren Counterfeit document.pdf

Oh and I’'m calling out Mr. Clark himself as a | NN 1t takes a_
more importantly a [JJJlfto ignore answering a common sense question that you and I
know the exact answer to too.

-don’t have the authority to make decisions in matters. They enjoy police reports
being filed against them.

Prove me wrong Mr. Clark. No one believes any of you. Anyone that has looked at my matter
1s paying close attention to it right now.

To say I haven’t shared all that information with legal authorities would be an understatement.

Answer the question, -

You -With the wrong person to pass a counterfeit document on, and more importantly to
steal money not due at the time.

Have my money ready. Before you make this matter go further than it should have. And if you
continue to spread your lies, it’s going to get you in further trouble ||| Gz

Brett Felber



From: Brett Felber

To:

Cc:

Subject: Ameren Complaint

Date: Friday, May 09, 2025 8:08:30 AM
Attachments: Ameren Counterfeit document.pdf

Good morning. Change of plans on when I’m giving you to come clean about the document.

Since it’s Mother’s Day weekend. I want to show you all what [l really deserve. |l
— deserve a police report, as for Mr, Clark, he deserves the
|

biggest police report

You have until 12 pm today Friday May 9, 2025 to come clean about the document and admit

it is a counterfeit and making arrangements to reimburse the S EGcIGINGGEGEGN
Mr. Clark answer these questions_

1) who 1s the author of the document?

2) paying attention to the document where 1s the actual email address and not fake email
address of the document?

3) where 1s Ameren Missouri’s time and date stamp along with encryption security detail?
4) where 1s Ameren’s customer service number as it 1s included on all payment agreements?

5) where is the header of the document that would state in the subject line the words your
payment agreement confirmation?

6) what 1s a so called “wutable™?

7) please admit www?2.ameren.com is not an email address?

You have until 12 pm today to admit it’s a fake document and make restitution plans or at
12:01 pm today I’m notifying the Cole County Sheriffs office *

Oh and I can also assure you, I can still file through EFIS if I want to, as the PSC doesn’t hold
the power or authority to block my credentials. I just choose not to file.

Otherwise , enjoy your Mother’s Day weekend ym_
Here’s your document too. |

Your grace period expires at 12 pm today. You’ve had almost two years to make plans. You’re




all in severe default and so can’t continue to take on the Commissions debt or Ameren’s debt.

Brett Felber



From: Brett Felber

To:

Cc:

Subject: Ameren Complaint

Date: Friday, May 09, 2025 10:10:59 AM

Two more hours to come clean about the counterfeit document before I get the Sheriffs Office
down the street from the PSC office imnvolved.

No one, and I mean no one outside the PSC believes you all.

In fact, I’ll probably send the PA’s office a memo with your email addresses so the PA’s
Office can assist in greeting an answer!

What do you think the Sheriffs Office will do once see they see its a clear counterfeit?

Brett Felber



STATE OF MISSOURI

OFFICE OF THE PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

| have compared the preceding copy with the original on file in
this office and | do hereby certify the same to be a true copy therefrom
and the whole thereof.

WITNESS my hand and seal of the Public Service Commission,

at Jefferson City, Missouri, this 9" day of May 2025.

Nancy Dippell
Secretary

Digitally signed
by MOPSC
M O P S C D);te: 2025.05.09

16:22:46 -05'00'



MISSOURI PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

May 9, 2025
File/Case No. EC-2025-0301
MO PSC Staff Office of the Public Counsel Brett Felber
Staff Counsel Department (OPC) Brett Felber
200 Madison Street, Suite 800 Marc Poston 316 Sonderen Street
P.O. Box 360 200 Madison Street, Suite 650 O'Fallon, MO 63366
Jefferson City, MO 65102 P.O. Box 2230 bfelber14@gmail.com

staffcounselservice@psc.mo.gov Jefferson City, MO 65102
opcservice@opc.mo.gov

MO PSC Staff Union Electric Company

Tracy Johnson Legal Department

200 Madison Street 1901 Chouteau Avenue
Jefferson City, MO 65101 P.O. Box 66149, Mail Code 1310
tracy.johnson@psc.mo.gov St. Louis, MO 63103

amerenmoservice@ameren.com

Enclosed find a certified copy of an Order or Notice issued in the above-referenced matter(s).

Sincerely,

Nancy Dippell
Secretary

Recipients listed above with a valid e-mail address will receive electronic service. Recipients without a valid e-mail
address will receive paper service.





